PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

Madison County Board of Supervisors
146 West Center Street
Canton, MS 39046 / 601-855-5534

September 3, 2024
To: Board of Supervisors
From: Kesha Jackson, Purchasing Clerk
Subject: Award Construction Service Term Bids

Attached are copies of recently opened construction service term bids and spreadsheet

tabulations. APAC-Mississippi. AJ Construction, ADCAMP, Dickerson & Bowen and Superior
Asphalt submitted electronic and sealed bids to indicate that they were interested in bidding on
Construction Service Term Bids for the period October 1, 2024 — September 30, 2025

[ recommended that the Board take the following actions:

(A) Acknowledge all bids received;

(B) Award Construction Service Term Bids

l.

Award the Construction Service Term Bid (Haul and Laydown of Asphalt) for
SC1-Type 8 Asphalt for the period of October 1, 2024 — September 30, 2025 to ADCAMP at
$104.00 per ton.

Award the First Alternate Construction Service Term Bid (Haul and Laydown of Asphalt) for
SCI1-Type 8 Asphalt for the period of October 1, 2024 — September 30, 2025 to AJ Construction
at $112.00 per ton.

Award the Construction Service Term Bid (Haul and Laydown of Asphalt) for Hot Mix Asphalt
9.5mm Mixture for the period of October 1, 2024 — September 30, 2025 to ADCAMP at
$104.00 per ton.

Award the First Alternate Construction Service Term Bid (Haul and Laydown of Asphalt) for
Hot Mix Asphalt 9.5mm Mixture for the period of October 1, 2024 — September 30, 2025 to
Al Construction at $112.00 per ton.

Award the Construction Service Term Bid (Haul and Laydown of Asphalt) for BB1 Base
Repair Asphalt for the period of October I, 2024 — September 30, 2025 to ADCAMP at
$103.00 per ton.



6. Award the First Alternate Construction Service Term Bid (Haul and Laydown of Asphalt) for
BB1 Base Repair Asphalt for the period of October 1, 2024 — September 30, 2025 to AJ
Construction at $112.00 per ton.

7. Award the Construction Service Term Bid (Haul and Laydown of Asphalt) Hot Mix Asphalt
12mm Mixture for the period of October 1, 2024 — September 30, 2025 to ADCAMP at
$104.00 per ton.

8. Award the First Alternative Construction Service Term Bid (Haul and Laydown of Asphalt)
Hot Mix Asphalt 12mm Mixture for the period of October 1, 2024 — September 30, 2025 to
ADCAMP at $112.00 per ton.

9. Award the Construction Service Term Bid (Road Base Repairs) for Dig out road depth of 11”
and replace with base asphalt for the period of October 1, 2024 — September 30, 2025 to
ADCAMP at $82.50 per square yard.

10. Award the First Alternative Construction Service Term Bid (Road Base Repairs) for Dig out
road depth of 11” and replace with base asphalt for the period of October 1, 2024 — September
30, 2025 to Dickerson & Bowen at $140.15 per square yard.

11. Award the Construction Service Term Bid (Road Base Repairs) for Dig out road depth of 11-
24” and replace with base asphalt for the period of October 1, 2024 — September 30, 2025 to
AJ Construction at $150.00 per square yard.

12. Award the Construction Service Term Bid (Cold Milling) for Cold Milling (All Depths)
County keeps Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement for the period of October 1, 2024 — September 30,
2025 to ADCAMP at $3.50 per square yard.

13. Award the Construction Service Term Bid (Cold Milling) for Cold Milling (All Depths)
Vendor removed Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement for the period of October 1, 2024 — September
30, 2025 to ADCAMP at $3.00 per square yard.

14. Award the First Alternative Construction Service Term Bid (Cold Milling) for Cold Milling
(All Depths) County keeps Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement for the period of October 1, 2024 —
September 30, 2025 to Dickerson & Bowen at $5.65 per square yard.

15. Award the First Alternative Construction Service Term Bid (Cold Milling) for Cold Milling

(All Depths) Vendor removed Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement for the period of October 1, 2024
— September 30, 2025 to AJ Construction at $4.00 per square yard.

Thank you in advance for your consideration of the above recommendations.



ASPHALT-RELATED CONSTRUCTION TABULATION FOR TERM BID PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2024 TO SEPTEMBER 30, 2025

HAULING & LAYDOWN ASPHALT

SC1TYPE 8 ASPHALT

HOT MIX ASPHALT 9.5MM MIXTURE
BB1 BASE ASPHALT

HOT MIX ASPHALT 12MM MIXTURE

ROAD BASE REPAIRS (11 INCH DEPTH) PER SQ YD
ROAD BASE REPAIRS (11-24 INCH DEPTH) PER SQ YD

COLD MILLING (ALL DEPTHS) PER SQ YD
COUNTY RETAINS OWNERSHIP OF MILLING RESIDUE
CONTRACTOR HAULS SAME TO ROAD DEPARTMENT

LOWEST AND BEST BIDDER
FIRST ALTERNATIVE BIDDER

APAC
CANTON

$135.00
$138.00
$127.50
$137.00

APAC
CANTON

NO BID
NO BID

APAC
CANTON

NO BID
NO BID

Al
CONSTRUCTION

$112.00
$112.00
$112.00
$112.00

Al
CONSTRUCTION

$150.00
§150.00

Al
CONSTRUCTION

$8.00
$4.00

DICKERSON & BOWEN

$143.50
$134.85
$126.60
$131.60

DICKERSON & BOWEN

$140.15
$238.20

DICKERSON & BOWEN

$5.65
$5.65

ADCAMP

$104.00
$104.00
$103.00
$104.00

ADCAMP

$82.50
$168.50

ADCAMP

$3.50
$3.00

SUPERIOR
ASPHALT

$158.00
$158.00
$141.00
$141.00

SUPERIOR
ASPHALT

$236.00
$280.00

SUPERIOR
ASPHALT

$7.50
$7.50
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MADISON COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS
CONSTRUCTIONSERVICFES
TERM BIDS FORPERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2024-SEPTEMBER 30,2025
SPECIFICATIONS

ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITIALED AND DATED BY AN
AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

The Madison County Board of Supervisors will receive sealed bids for the following:

Construction Services:
Haul and Laydown of Asphalt

Haul and Laydown of SC-I, Type 8 Asphalt
Haul and Laydown of 9.5 mm Asphalt

Haul and Laydown of BB-I Asphalt

Haul and Laydown of 12mm Asphalt

Road Base Repair

Base Repair of up to 11" depth
Base Repair of 11-24" depth

. Cold Milli

Cold Milling, All Depths, County keeps Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement
Cold Milling, All Depths, Vendor removes Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement

Commodities:
Asphalt

SC1-Type 8
SC1-Type 2

CRS 2-Liquid Asphalt
Cold Mix Asphalt
BBI1

Gravel

610unwashedlimestone aggregate
#7washed limestoneaggregate
#57washed limestoneaggregate
#89washed limestoneaggregate
#100Rip Rap

#200 Rip Rap

#300 Rip II{ap
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WashedRoad Gravel
Clay Gravel

HDPE (Plastic Pipes)
12" diameter by foot

15” diameter by foot

18” diameter by foot

24" diameter by foot

30” diameter by foot
24”Band

30"Band

\luminized CMP (Pipes) (14 Gauge Tvpe 2)

24” diameter by foot

30” diameter by foot

24” Band

30”Band

48” diameter by foot gauge
60” diameter by foot gauge

Sealed Bids may be submitted by either of the following methods:

Sealed Bids will be accepted until 10:00 a.m. on Thursday, August 15, 2024, by electronic
submission at http://www.madison-co.com/bids or in a sealed envelope at the Madison
County Chancery Clerk's Office, Rooms 225-228, 125 West North Street, Canton, MS
39046.

Electronic bids will be received until 10:00 a.m. on Thursday, August 15, 2024, as a PDF
file via Madison County's website at http://www.madison-co.com/bids. Each bidder
submitting a bid electronically shall include a signed copy of Madison County's bid sheet as
part of its PDF bid submittal.

Non-electronic bids will be received until 10:00 a.m. on August 15, 2024 at the Madison
County Chancery Clerk's Office, Rooms 225-228, 125 West North Street, Canton, MS
39046. All sealed bids submitted to the Chancery Clerk's office shall have the bidder's name
and the phrase “Term Bid” for which a bid is being submitted written on the outside face of
the envelope. If any envelope is not so marked, said bid shall not be opened and considered.
Each bidder submitting a bid electronically shall include a signed copy of Madison County's
bid sheet as part of its PDF bid submittal.

All bids must comply with the specifications provided. Madison County reserves the
right to amend the specifications, as necessary, and agrees to notify all who have
requested bid packets from the Madison County Board of Supervisors. No Guaranteed

Page 2 of 10



ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITIALED, DATED AND
SUBMITTED ON THE COUNTY FURNISHED BID FORMS

The Madison County Board of Supervisors reserves the right to reject any and all bids,
and to waive any informalities or irregularities in the bids received. For any questions
relating to the electronic submission process, please call Kesha Jackson at
601.855.5534. Madison County Board of Supervisors

By: (s) Kesha Jackson, Purchase Clerk Publication Dates: July 20, 2023 & July 27, 2023 on

Madison County Journal

Page30f 10



Construction Services Term Bid

Haul and Laydown of Asphalt

The road paving term bid shall be a sum-key price that includes furnishing, transporting,
and laying down the asphalt. The asphalt may come from any plant of the contractor's
choosing.

SC 1 Type, Type 8 Asphalt $104.00 Perton
Hot Mix Asphalt 9.5mm Mixture $104.00 Perton
BB-1 Asphalt $103.00 Perton

Hot Mix Asphalt 12mm Mixture $104.00 Perton

(v ) Mark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

In&ﬂate H laizq
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Construction Service Term Bid

Road Base Repair

Dig out road to depth of 11"and replace with base asphalt $82-50 per square yard

$168.50
Dig out road to depth of 11-24" and replace with base asphalt Per square yard

(v )Mark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

In&Date& “
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Construction Services Term Bid

Cold Milling
Cold Milling (ALL DEPTHS) County keeps Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement

County retains ownership of milling residue. Contractor shall be responsible for
loading; transporting and delivering said milling residue to the Madison County

Road Department located at 3137 South Liberty Street, Canton, MS.
$3.50 Per square yard

Cold Milling, (ALL DEPTHS) Vendor removed Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement
Contractor assumes ownership of milling residue and shall be responsible for

loading, transporting, and disposing of said millingresidue.

$3.00Per square yard

(v ) Mark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

Page 5 of 10



NOTE: ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITIALED AND DATED
BY ANAUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a term bid by the Madison
County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the materials or services on this bid form,
that it will provide said materials or services in a timely manner at the awarded term bid
price for the duration of said term bid period. The company acknowledges there are

No Minimum Guarantees on any term bid. The below signed company further agrees
that it will not provide quantities of a materials or services in an amount greater than is
listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed
company agrees that if it does provide materials or services in an amount greater than
that listed on the purchase order, that it will not hold Madison County responsible for
the quantity of such materials or services that exceeds the purchase order amount.

For use in your calculation of Lowest and Best Bid, note here the
Number of Miles from your Company Plant to the Madison County
Road Department

e, Miles

Company Name: ADCAMP, INC.

Address: 1353 FLOWOOD DRIVE

FLOWOOD, MS 39232

Telephone #: 601-939-4493

Cell Phone#: 601-517-6793

Fax#: 601-939-4676

Email: jason@adcampinc.com

Authorized Representative’s Signatu = Date 08/15/2024

Print Authorized Representative’s Name_ JASON H. BREWER

The specifications and bid forms for the above-listed term bids are on file and
open for public inspection at the Madison County Chancery Clerk's Office,
Rooms 225-228, and 125 West North Street, Canton, MS 39046. A PDF copy of
the specifications and bid sheets may be procured, at no charge, by either of the
following methods:

. Download a copy from Madison County's website at http://www.madison-co.com/bids

. Email a request to kesha.jackson@madison-co.com

lniti&t&atem“
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APAC-Mississippi, Inc.
P.O. Box 24508
Jackson, Mississippi 39225-4508

Certificate of Responsibility Number 95
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MADISON COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS
CONSTRUCTIONSERVICES

TERM BIDS FORPERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2024-SEPTEMBER 30,2025
SPECIFICATIONS
ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITIALED AND DATED BY AN
AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

The Madison County Board of Supervisors will receive sealed bids for the following:

Construction Services:
Haul and Laydown of Asphalt

Haul and Laydown of SC-I, Type 8 Asphalt
Haul and Laydown of 9.5 mm Asphalt

Haul and Laydown of BB-I Asphalt

Haul and Laydown of 12mm Asphalt

Road Base Repair

Base Repair of up to 11" depth
Base Repair of 11-24" depth

Cold Milli

Cold Milling, All Depths, County keeps Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement
Cold Milling, All Depths, Vendor removes Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement

Commoditjes:
Asphalt

SC1-Type 8
SC1-Type 2

CRS 2-Liquid Asphalt
Cold Mix Asphalt
BBl

Gravel
610unwashedlimestone aggregate

#7washed limestoneaggregate
#57washed limestoneaggregate
#39washed limestoneaggregate
#100Rip Rap

#200Rip Rap

#300Rip Rap

Page 1 of 10



R o AD SR W

>

™o opo TP

Washed Road Gravel
ClayGravel

HDPE (Plastic Pipes)
12" diameter by foot

15 diameter by foot

18” diameter by foot

24” diameter by foot

30" diameter by foot
24”Band

30”Band

24” diameter by foot

30” diameter by foot

24” Band

30”Band

48 diameter by foot gauge
60” diameter by foot gauge

Sealed Bids may be submitted by either of the following methods:

Sealed Bids will be accepted until 10:00 am. on Thursday, August 15, 2024, by electronic
submission at http://www.madison-co.com/bids or in a sealed envelope at the Madison
County Chancery Clerk's Office, Rooms 225-228, 125 West North Street, Canton, MS
39046. ‘

Electronic bids will be received until 10:00 a.m. on Thursday, August 15, 2024, as aPDF
file via Madison County's website at http://www.madison-co.com/bids. Each bidder
submitting a bid electronically shall include a signed copy of Madison County's bid sheet as
part of its PDF bid submittal.

Non-electronic bids will be received until 10:00a.m. on August 15, 2024 at the Madison
County Chancery Clerk's Office, Rooms 225-228, 125 West North Street, Canton, MS
39046. All sealed bids submitted to the Chancery Clerk’s office shall have the bidder's name
and the phrase “Term Bid” for which a bid is being submitted written on the outside face of
the envelope. If any envelope is not so marked, said bid shall not be opened and considered.
Each bidder submitting a bid electronically shall include a signed copy of Madison County's
bid sheet as part of its PDF bid submittal.

All bids must comply with the specifications provided. Madison County reserves the
right to amend the specifications, as necessary, and agrees to notify all who have
requested bid packets from the Madison County Board of Supervisors. No Guaranteed

Page 2 of 10



ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITIALED, DATED AND
SUBMITTED ON THE COUNTY FURNISHED BID FORMS

The Madison County Board of Supervisors reserves the right to reject any and all bids,
and to waive any informalities or irregularities in the bids received. For any questions
relating to the electronic submission process, please call Kesha J ackson at
601.855.5534. Madison County Board of Supervisors

By: (s) Kesha Jackson, Purchase Clerk Publication Dates: July 20, 2023 & July 27, 2023 on

Madison County Journal

Page 3 of 10



Construction Services Term Bid

Haul and Lavdown of Asphalt

The road paving term bid shall be a sum-key price that includes furnishing, transporting,
and laying down the asphalt. The asphalt may come from any plant of the contractor's
choosing. i

SC 1 Type, Type 8 Asphalt ,{:5:5 Per ton

o0
Hot Mix Asphalt 9.5mm Mixture /3%~ Perton
X4
BB-1 Asphalt /Z 7 " perton
o0

Hot Mix Asphalt 12mm Mixture /.3 2 ~ Perton

(v ) Mark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

mitia AP} Date 4{14!1"{
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Construction Service Term Bid

Road Base Repair

Dig out road to depth of 11"and replace with base asphalt /ﬁ,Per square yard

y

Dig out road to depth of 11-24" and replace with base asphalt Per square yard

V (v)Mark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.
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Construction Services Term Bid

Cold Milling
Cold Milling (ALL DEPTHS) County keeps Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement

County retains ownership of milling residue. Contractor shall be responsible for
loading; transporting and delivering said milling residue to the Madison County

Road Department located at 3137 South Liberty Street, Canto !
Per square yard

Cold Milling, (ALL DEPTHS) Vendor removed Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement

Contractor assumes ownership of milling residue and shall be responsible for

loading, transporting, and disposing of said milling residu
4 z Per square yard

-
~

/ (v")Mark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

InitiMDate 1 ‘2«51 ré‘?‘
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NOTE: ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITIALED AND DATED
BY AN AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a term bid by the Madison
County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the materials or services on this bid form,
that it will provide said materials or services in a timely manner at the awarded term bid
price for the duration of said term bid period. The company acknowledges there are

No Minimum Guarantees on any term bid. The below signed company further agrees
that it will not provide quantities of a materials or services in an amount greater than is
listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed
company agrees that if it does provide materials or services in an amount greater than
that listed on the purchase order, that it will not hold Madison County responsible for
the quantity of such materials or services that exceeds the purchase order amount.

For use in your calculation of Lowest and Best Bid, note here the
Number of Miles from your Company Plant to the Madison County

Road Department
LS Miles

Company Name: /%/‘7//() // 55:{—5;@0. . Jf/p
Address: rp 0. gayé j%lﬁ_Dg
Tackson Ms  F725-4508
Telephone #: _ (0 |-37b- 4E00
Cell Phonett:_ (o1 - G54 *£7ék
Fax#: _(OD\|- 374~ 4’0'5_5
Email: '\O[/\V\.MVI & QMC. ol p
Authonzed Representatlve s Slguature £ Date ?/Z'}f/?;ﬁ

7
Print Authorized Representative’s Name 76!’/}/ M&U

The specifications and bid forms for the above-listed term bids are on file and
open for public inspection at the Madison County Chancery Clerk's Office,
Rooms 225-228, and 125 West North Street, Canton, MS 39046. A PDF copy of
the specifications and bid sheets may be procured, at no charge, by either of the
following methods:

. Download a copy from Madison County's website at http:/www.madison-co.com/bids

. Email a request to kesha.jackson@ madison-co.com

Im'tiai/w Date || Z “f
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MADISON COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS

CONSTRUCTIONSERVICES

TERM BIDSFORPERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2024-SEPTEMBER 30,2025

SPECIFICATIONS

ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITIALED AND DATED BY AN

AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

The Madison County Board of Supervisors will receive sealed bids for the following:

Construction Services:

Haul and Laydown of Asphalt

Haul and Laydown of SC-I, Type 8 Asphalt
Haul and Laydown of 9.5 mm Asphalt

Haul and Laydown of BB-I Asphalt

Haul and Laydown of 12mm Asphalt

Read Base Repair

Base Repair of up to I I" depth
Base Repair of 11-24" depth

Cold Milli

Cold Milling, All Depths, County keeps Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement
Cold Milling, All Depths, Vendor removes Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement

C lities:
Asphalt

SCI1-Type 8
SCI1-Type 2

CRS 2-Liquid Asphalt
Cold Mix Asphalt
BBI

Gravel

610unwashedlimestone aggregate
#7washed limestone aggregate
#57washed limestone aggregate
#89washed limestoneaggregate
#100 Rip Rap

#200 Rip Rap

#300RipRap

Page 10f 10
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Washed Road Gravel
Clay Gravel

HDPE, (Plastic Pipes)
12" diameter by foot

15” diameter by foot
18” diameter by foot

24” diameter by foot
30" diameter by foot

24”Band

30"Band

Aluminized CMP (Pipes) (14 G Type 2)
24” diameter by foot

30” diameter by foot

24” Band

30” Band

48” diameter by foot gauge
60 diameter by foot gauge

Sealed Bids may be submitted by either of the following methods:

Sealed Bids will be accepted until 10:00 a.m. on Thursday, August 15, 2024, by electronic
submission at http://www.madison-co.com/bids or in a sealed envelope at the Madison
County Chancery Clerk's Office, Rooms 225-228, 125 West North Street, Canton, MS
39046.

Electronic bids will be received until 10:00 a.m. on Thursday, August 15, 2024, as a PDF
file via Madison County's website at http://www.madison-co.com/bids. Each bidder
submitting a bid electronically shall include a signed copy of Madison County's bid sheet as
part of its PDF bid submittal.

Non-electronic bids will be received until 10:00 a.m. on August 15, 2024 at the Madison
County Chancery Clerk's Office, Rooms 225-228, 125 West North Street, Canton, MS
39046. All sealed bids submitted to the Chancery Clerk's office shall have the bidder's name
and the phrase “Term Bid” for which abid is being submitted written on the outside face of
the envelope. If any envelope is not so marked, said bid shall not be opened and considered.
Each bidder submitting a bid electronically shall include a signed copy of Madison County's
bid sheet as part of its PDF bid submittal.

All bids must comply with the specifications provided. Madison County reserves the
right to amend the specifications, as necessary, and agrees to notify all who have
requested bid packets from the Madison County Board of Supervisors. No Guaranteed
Minimum.

Page 2 of 10




ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITIALED, DATED AND
SUBMITTED ON THE COUNTY FURNISHED BID FORMS

The Madison County Board of Supervisors reserves the right to reject any and all bids,
and to waive any informalities or irregularities in the bids received. For any questions
relating to the electronic submission process, please call Kesha Jackson at
601.855.5534. Madison County Board of Supervisors

By: (s) Kesha Jackson, Purchase Clerk Publication Dates: July 20, 2023 & July 27, 2023 on

Madison County Journal

Page 3 of 10



Construction Services Term Bid

lan n hal

The road paving term bid shall be a sum-key price that includes furnishing, transporting,
and laying down the asphalt. The asphalt may come from any plant of the contractor's
choosing.

SC 1 Type, Type 8 Asphalt I i Per ton

Hot Mix Asphalt 9.5mm Mixture ‘ 1'% Per ton
BB-1 Asphalt l\’l Per ton
Hot Mix Asphalt 12mm Mixture Wi Per ton

(v )»Mark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

Initial &£~ Date 2
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Construction Service Term Bid
Road Base Repair
Dig out road to depth of 11"and replace with base asphalt / SO per square yard

Dig out road to depth of 11-24" and replace with base asphalt [SD Pper square yard

(v ) Mark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

Initial M/ Date g! !EI W
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Construction Services Term Bid

Cold Millin
Cold Milling (ALL DEPTHS) County keeps Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement

County retains ownership of milling residue. Contractor shall be responsible for
loading: transporting and delivering said milling residue to the Madison County
Road Department located at 3137 South Liberty Street, Canton, MS.

B> Per square yard
Cold Milling, (ALL DEPTHS) Vendor removed Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement
Contractor assumes ownership of milling residue and shall be responsible for

loading, transporting, and disposing of said milling residue.

ﬂiPer square yard

(v ) Mark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

iial A~ Date 3|14 20
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NOTE: ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITIALED AND DATED
BY ANAUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a term bid by the Madison
County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the materials or services on this bid form,
that it will provide said materials or services in a timely manner at the awarded term bid
price for the duration of said term bid period. The company acknowledges there are

No Minimum Guarantees on any term bid. The below signed company further agrees
that it will not provide quantities of a materials or services in an amount greater than is
listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed
company agrees that if it does provide materials or services in an amount greater than
that listed on the purchase order, that it will not hold Madison County responsible for
the quantity of such materials or services that exceeds the purchase order amount.

For use in your calculation of Lowest and Best Bid, note here the
Number of Miles from your Company Plant to the Madison County

Road Department
2.8 Miles

Company Name: __ IS (opSTR ot Tion ST
Address: _9.0. Box 2004
Wrose® s 23130
Telephone #: O\ - 78 - 7282
Cell Phone#:_(s0\~ 2¥2 - 3¢\p
Fax#:
Email: _Sean (€ psc- wms. Lowa

Authorized Representative’s Signature % Date Ez 14 2004

N
Print Authorized Representative’s Name S@Ab (Jb?\;ti"f

The specifications and bid forms for the above-listed term bids are on file and
open for public inspection at the Madison County Chancery Clerk's Office,
Rooms 225-228, and 125 West North Street, Canton, MS 39046. A PDF copy of
the specifications and bid sheets may be procured, at no charge, by either of the
following methods:

. Download a copy from Madison County's website at http://www.madison-co.com/bids

. Email a request to kesha.jackson@madison-co.com

Initial €4_~ Date ﬂ\ “ lzow
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DICKERSON
~ B

BOWEN

A Highwey Conslruction Cumpany

Sealed Bid for

Madison County Board of Supervisors

August 15, 2024 @ 10:00 am

125 West North Street

Canton, MS 39046

Term Bids October 1, 2024 Thru September 30, 2025
By Dickerson & Bowen, Inc.

PO Box 1008

Brookhaven, MS 39602-1008

Certificate of Responsibility No. 12
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MADISON COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS

CONSTRUCTIONSERVICES

TERMBIDS FOR PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2024-SEPTEMBER 30,2025

SPECIFICATIONS

ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITIALED AND DATED BY AN
AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

The Madison County Board of Supervisors will receive sealed bids for the following:

Construction Services:

Haul and Laydown of Asphalt

Haul and Laydown of SC-I, Type 8 Asphalt
Haul and Laydown of 9.5 mm Asphalt

Haul and Laydown of BB-I Asphalt

Haul and Laydown of 12mm Asphalt

Road Base Repair

Base Repair of up to II” depth
Base Repair of 11-24" depth

LCold Milling

Cold Milling, All Depths, County keeps Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement
Cold Milling, All Depths, Vendor removes Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement

Commodities:
Asphalt

SCl1-Type 8
SC1-Type 2

CRS 2-Liquid Asphalt
Cold Mix Asphalt
BBI

Gravel

610unwashedlimestone aggregate
#7washed limestoneaggregate
#57washed limestoneaggregate
#89washed limestone aggregate
#100RipRap

#200Rip Rap

#300 RipRap
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Washed Road Gravel!
ClayGravel

HDPE (Plastic Pipes)

12" diameter by foot
15" diameter by foot
18" diameter by foot
24" diameter by foot
30" diameter by foot
24"Band

30"Band

Aluminized CMP (Pipes) (14 Gauge Tvpe 2)

24 diameter by foot

30” diameter by foot

24” Band

30”Band

48" diameter by foot gauge
60" diameter by foot gauge

Sealed Bids may be submitted by either of the following methods:

Sealed Bids will be accepted until 10:00 am. on Thursday, August 15, 2024, by electronic
submission at http://www.madison-co.com/bids or in a sealed envelope at the Madison
County Chancery Clerk's Office, Rooms 225-228, 125 West North Street, Canton, MS
39046,

Electronic bids will be received until 10:00 a.m. on Thursday, August 15, 2024, as a PDF
file via Madison County’s website at http://www.madison-co.convbids. Each bidder
submitting a bid electronically shall include a signed copy of Madison County’s bid sheet as
part of its PDF bid submittal.

Non-electronic bids will be received until 10:00 a.m. on August 15, 2024 at the Madison
County Chancery Clerk’s Office, Rooms 225-228, 125 West North Street, Canton, MS
39046. All sealed bids submitted to the Chancery Clerk's office shall have the bidder’s name
and the phrase “Term Bid” for which a bid is being submitted written on the outside face of
the envelope. If any envelope is not so marked, said bid shall not be opened and considered.
Each bidder submitting a bid electronically shall include a signed copy of Madison County's
bid sheet as part of its PDF bid submittal.

All bids must comply with the specifications provided. Madison County reserves the
right to amend the specifications, as necessary, and agrees to notify all who have
requested bid packets from the Madison County Board of Supervisors. No Guaranteed

Minimum.
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ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITIALED, DATED AND
SUBMITTED ON THE COUNTY FURNISHED BID FORMS

The Madison County Board of Supervisors reserves the right to reject any and all bids,
and to waive any informalities or irregularities in the bids received. For any questions
relating to the electronic submission process, please call Kesha Jackson at
601.855.5534. Madison County Board of Supervisors

By: (8) Kesha Jackson, Purchase Clerk Publication Dates: July 20, 2023 & July 27, 2023 on

Madison County Journal
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Construction Services Term Bid

Hauland Laydown of Asphalt

The road paving term bid shall be a sum-key price that includes furnishing, transporting,
and laying down the asphalt. The asphalt may come from any plant of the contractor's

choosing.
50
SC 1 Type, Type 8 Asphalt 1 Iz, Per ton
13485
Hot Mix Asphalt 9.5mm Mixture Per ton
o
BB-1 Asphalt H 126.6 Per ton
) ) Fizt.40
Hot Mix Asphalt 12mm Mixture Per ton

(¥") Mark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

lnitinlé C Date 8/ IY/Zoz-f
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Construction Service Term Bid
Road Base Repair
. , $1dp.0s
Dig out road to depth of 11"and replace with base asphalt ' Per square yard

o
Dig out road to depth of 11 -24" and replace with base asphaltj?'g?‘:I Per square yard

(v") Mark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

Initial /C' Date /1572024
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Construction Services Term Bid

Cold Milling
Cold Milling (ALL DEPTHS) County keeps Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement

County retains ownership of milling residue. Contractor shall be responsible for
loading; transporting and delivering said milling residue to the Madison County

Road Department located at 3137 South Liberty Street, Canton, MS,
A5 65 per square yard

Cold Milling, (ALL DEPTHS) Vendor removed Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement
Contractor assumes ownership of milling residue and shall be responsible for

loading, transporting, and disposing of said millingresidue.
Bsis Per square yard

(v") Mark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

Initial l’(’ Date 9/15‘/205"{
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NOTE: ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITIALED AND DATED
BY AN AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a term bid by the Madison
County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the materials or services on this bid form,
that it will provide said materials or services in a timely manner at the awarded term bid
price for the duration of said term bid period. The company acknowledges there are

No Minimum Guarantees on any term bid. The below signed company further agrees
that it will not provide quantities of a materials or services in an amount greater than is
listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed
company agrees that if it does provide materials or services in an amount greater than
that listed on the purchase order, that it will not hold Madison County responsible for
the quantity of such materials or services that exceeds the purchase order amount.

For use in your calculation of Lowest and Best Bid, note here the
Number of Miles from your Company Plant te the Madison County
Road Department

28 Miles

Company Name: Dickerson & Bowen, Inc.
Address: P.O. Box 1008

Brookhaven, MS 39602-1008
Telephone #: 601-969-2002
Cell Phone#: 601-754-2795
Fax#: 601-969-2004

Email; bclarke@dickersonandbowen.com

- z 2L F
Authorized Representative’s Signaer,. Date 8/15/2024

Print Authorized Representative’s Name Blake Clarke

The specifications and bid forms for the above-listed term bids are on file and
open for public inspection at the Madison County Chancery Clerk's Office,
Rooms 225-228, and 125 West North Street, Canton, MS 39046. A PDF copy of
the specifications and bid sheets may be procured, at no charge, by either of the
following methods:

. Download a copyfrom Madison County's website at http://www.madison-co.com/bids

Email a request to kesha.jackson@madison-co.com

it 2 C Do 8/15/2024
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5990 I-55 South
Byram, MS 39272
601-376-3000
COR #: 084757

Bid To: Madison County Board of Supervisors
125 West North Street
Canton, Mississippi 39046

Bid for:  Construction Services
Term Bid for October 1, 2023 to September 30, 2025

Bid Date: 8/15/24
Bid Time: 10:00AM



=
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MADISON COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS

CONSTRUCTIONSERVICES

TERM BIDS FORPERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2024-SEPTEMBER 30,2025

SPECIFICATIONS

ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITIALED AND DATED BY AN

AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

The Madison County Board of Supervisors will receive sealed bids for the following:

Construction Services:
Haul and Laydown of Asphalt

Haul and Laydown of SC-I, Type 8 Asphalt
Haul and Laydown of 9.5 mm Asphalt
Haul and Laydown of BB-I Asphalt

Haul and Laydown of 12mm Asphalt

Road Base Repair

Base Repair of up to 11" depth
Base Repair of 11-24" depth

Cold Milli

Cold Milling, All Depths, County keeps Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement
Cold Milling, All Depths, Vendor removes Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement

Commodities:
Asphalt

SC1-Type8
SC1-Type 2

CRS 2-Liquid Asphalt
Cold Mix Asphalt
BBI1

Gravel
610unwashedlimestoneaggregate

#7washed limestoneaggregate
#57washed limestoneaggregate
#89washed limestoneaggregate
#100 RipRap

#200 RipRap

#300 RipRap
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WashedRoad Gravel
Clay Gravel

HDPE (Plastic Pipes)
12” diameter by foot

15" diameter by foot

18” diameter by foot

24” diameter by foot

30" diameter by foot
24"Bend

30"Bend

Aluminized CMP (Pipes) (14 G Type2)
24 diameter by foot

30 diameter by foot
24”Band

30”Band

48” diameter by foot gauge
60> diameter by foot gauge

Sealed Bids may be submitted by either of the following methods:

Sealed Bids will be accepted until 10:00 a.m. on Thursday, August 15, 2024, by electronic
submission at http:/www.madison-co.com/bids or in a sealed envelope at the Madison
County Chancery Clerk's Office, Rooms 225-228, 125 West North Street, Canton, MS
39046.

Electronic bids will be received until 10:00 a.m. on Thursday, August 15, 2024, as a PDF
file via Madison County's website at http://www.madison-co.com/bids. Each bidder
submitting a bid electronically shall include a signed copy of Madison County’s bid sheet as
part of its PDF bid submittal.

Non-electronic bids will be received until 10:00 a.m. on August 15, 2024 at the Madison
County Chancery Clerk's Office, Rooms 225-228, 125 West North Street, Canton, MS
39046. All sealed bids submitted to the Chancery Clerk's office shall have the bidder's name
and the phrase “Term Bid” for which a bid is being submitted written on the outside face of
the envelope. If any envelope is not so marked, said bid shall not be opened and considered.
Each bidder submitting a bid electronically shall include a signed copy of Madison County's
bid sheet as part of its PDF bid submittal.

All bids must comply with the specifications provided. Madison County reserves the
right to amend the specifications, as necessary, and agrees to notify all who have
requested bid packets from the Madison County Board of Supervisors. No Guaranteed
Minimum.
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ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITIALED, DATED AND
SUBMITTED ON THE COUNTY FURNISHED BID FORMS

The Madison County Board of Supervisors reserves the right to reject any and all bids,
and to waive any informalities or irregularities in the bids received. For any questions
relating to the electronic submission process, please call Kesha Jackson at
601.855.5534. Madison County Board of Supervisors

By: (s) Kesha Jackson, Purchase Clerk Publication Dates: July 20, 2023 & July 27, 2023 on

Madison County Journal
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Construction Services Term Bid

Haul and Laydown of Asphalt

The road paving term bid shall be a sum-key price that includes furnishing, transporting,
and laying down the asphalt. The asphalt may come from any plant of the contractor's
choosing.

SC 1 Type, Type 8 Asphalt $158.00  perton
Hot Mix Asphalt 9.5mm Mixture $158.00  perton
BB-1 Asphalt $141.00  perton

Hot Mix Asphalt 12mm Mixture $141.00 _ Perton

(v ) Mark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

Initial‘ﬁ/ Date. A‘s\‘]"{
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Construction Service Term Bid

Dig out road to depth of 11"and replace with base asphalt $236.00per square yard

Dig out road to depth of 11-24" and replace with base asphalt $280.00Per square yard

(v") Mark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

Initial :A”/Date %{'}{{tﬂ
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Construction Services Term Bid

Cold Millin
Cold Milling (ALL DEPTHS) County keeps Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement

County retains ownership of milling residue. Contractor shall be responsible for
loading; transporting and delivering said milling residue to the Madison County

Road Department located at 3137 South Liberty Street, Canton, MS.
$7.50 _ Per square yard

Cold Milling, (ALL DEPTHS) Vendor removed Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement
Contractor assumes ownership of milling residue and shall be responsible for

loading, transporting, and disposing of said millingresidue.
$7.50 _ Per square yard

(v ) Mark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

Initial ZUZ Date At !1"3(
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NOTE: ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITIALED AND DATED
BY AN AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a term bid by the Madison
County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the materials or services on this bid form,
that it will provide said materials or services in a timely manner at the awarded term bid
price for the duration of said term bid period. The company acknowledges there are

No Minimum Guarantees on any term bid. The below signed company further agrees
that it will not provide quantities of a materials or services in an amount greater than is
listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed
company agrees that if it does provide materials or services in an amount greater than
that listed on the purchase order, that it will not hold Madison County responsible for
the quantity of such materials or services that exceeds the purchase order amount.

For use in your calculation of Lowest and Best Bid, note here the
Number of Miles from your Company Plant to the Madison County
Road Department

34 Miles

Company Name: Superior Asphalt, Inc.
Address: 5990 I-55 South, Byram, MS 39272

Telephone #: 601-376-3000

Cell Phone#:
Fax#: 601-372-5004

Email: alyles@wgyates.com

Date 8/15/24
LES, PROJECT EXECUTIVE

Authorized Representative’s Signatur,

Print Authorized Representative’s Name ALAN

The specifications and bid forms for the above-listed term bids are on file and
open for public inspection at the Madison County Chancery Clerk's Office,
Rooms 225-228, and 125 West North Street, Canton, MS 39046. A PDF copy of
the specifications and bid sheets may be procured, at no charge, by either of the
following methods:

. Download a copy from Madison County's website at http://www.madison-co.com/bids

. Email a request to kesha.jackson@madison-co.com

il e P4
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